
 

Q. What is AgLogic Chemical, LLC?  

AgLogic Chemical, LLC is an affiliate of MEY Corporation and holds the U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency (EPA) registration for AgLogic™ 15G brand aldicarb pesticide and is 
currently in the process of returning it to the market for the 2016 growing season. Bayer 
CropScience formerly marketed a similar product under the brand name of Temik.  

Q. What is AgLogic™ 15G aldicarb pesticide? 

AgLogic™ 15G is a carbamate pesticide that contains the active ingredient aldicarb that controls 
nematodes, a wide range of piercing and sucking pests and certain chewing pests through 
direct contact with treated soil and systemically from residues absorbed and translocated by the 
developing root system. 

Q. What crops are currently labeled for AgLogic™ 15G? 

Currently labeled crops include cotton, peanuts, soybeans, sugarbeets, drybeans and sweet 
potatoes.  

Q. What pests are listed for control on the AgLogic™ 15G label? 

Pests controlled include nematodes, thrips, aphids, leafhoppers, lygus, whiteflies and mites. 
Check the product label for the full list of pests controlled.  

Q. In what states is AgLogic™ 15G labeled? 

For the 2016 season, AgLogic™ 15G will only be labeled in the state of Georgia due to limited 
availability. Plans are in place to label the product in additional states for the 2017 season. 

Q. When will AgLogic™ 15G be available?  

Product will be available only to Georgia growers starting in March and continuing through the 
planting season. AgLogic™ 15G will be available in 2016 initially as a 15% corn cob grit 
formulation and later as a 15% granular gypsum product. 

Q. What will the AgLogic™ 15G supply be for 2016? 

In 2016, product volumes will be limited to Georgia Restricted Use Pesticide licensees to ensure 
a coordinated, well-controlled product launch. 

Q. Is AgLogic™ 15G expected to perform comparably to its predecessor Temik? 

AgLogic™ 15G is manufactured in the U.S. to the highest possible standards and similar to 
Bayer CropScience’s predecessor product, Temik 15G. Its performance is expected to be 
comparable to Temik 15G.  



Q. Can I use the same application equipment for AgLogic™ 15G that I used for Temik? 

Yes. The same type of application equipment can be used for AgLogic™ 15G that was used for 
Temik 15G. However, all equipment must be checked and recalibrated to ensure proper flow of 
the product. 

Q. Why did AgLogic, LLC decide to bring aldicarb back to the market? 

AgLogic, LLC decided to bring back this product because of its unique and unmatched pest 
control activity, its documented record of superior pest control, its outstanding fit in Integrated 
Pest Management (IPM) programs and strong industry wide support for its continued use. 

Q. How will AgLogic™ 15G be packaged? 

The corn cob grit formulation will be packaged in two 30-lb. bags per box. Later, the gypsum 
formulation will be sold and distributed in 45 lb. boxes. 

Q. Where will AgLogic™ 15G be manufactured? 

AgLogic™ 15G will be manufactured in the southeastern U.S. It is expected to create a 
substantial number of jobs within the manufacturing facility and other jobs in sales, marketing 
and support positions. 

Q. Are there special requirements a grower has to meet to be able to buy AgLogic™ 15G? 

Yes. In 2016, growers must have a current Georgia restricted use pesticide license and pass an 
on-line certification course in order to purchase AgLogic™ 15G. 

Q. Why is a certification course required to buy and use AgLogic™ 15G? 

AgLogic Chemical, LLC is firmly committed to the conscientious labeled use and diligent 
stewardship of AgLogic™ 15G brand aldicarb pesticide in order to ensure the continued long-
term availability of this valuable pest management product. The dealer and grower certification 
courses are the first steps in implementing the precautions and measures deemed important to 
ensure proper distribution, application, use, storage and if necessary disposal of the product. 

Q. How does a grower become certified to purchase AgLogic™ 15G? 

In 2016, contact your local Georgia CNI dealer to discuss product supply and the certification 
process. 

Q. Where do I find technical, sales support and additional information for AgLogic™ 15G? 

Product support is available at CNI, its authorized dealers and AgLogic Chemical, LLC. 

AgLogic Chemical, LLC 

121 S. Estes Dr., Ste. 101 

Chapel Hill, NC 27514 

919-932-5800 

www.aglogicchemical.com 

CNI 

800 Business Park Drive 

Highway 82 West 

Leesburg, GA 31763 

229-883-7050 

www.cniag.com 

 


